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ASR Clearwell No. 1 Potable Water Tank
3.0 MG; 179 feet diam.; 16.7 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 6,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 125.00 250.00
1. TOTAL 2,330.00 7,498.00
Austin Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.5 MG; 88 feet diam.; 138 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,400.00 2,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 125.00 250.00
2. TOTAL 2,230.00 3,498.00
Avenue B (Brackenridge) Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
0.4 MG; 54 feet diam.; 28 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A NO BID
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,250.00 1,750.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 125.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 4,000.00 650.00
3. TOTAL 6,055.00 3,648.00
Bitters Potable Water Hydro-Pneumatic Tank
0.025 MG; 10 feet diam.; 45 feet length
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 299.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 125.00
Rained Cleaning Cost out of Service 450.00 995.00
4, TOTAL 830.00 1,419.00
Bitters Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
5 MG; 165.0 feet diam.; 33.0 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 8,400.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 250.00
5. TOTAL 2,555.00 9,648.00
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Brooks Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
0.5 MG; 54 feet diam.; 27 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (no drained) 1,400.00 2,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,000.00 850.00
6. TOTAL 4,230.00 4,348.00
Coliseum Reuse Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.5 MG,; 75 feet diam.; 43 feet bowl height; 140 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,400.00 2,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 850.00
7. TOTAL 4,405.00 4,248.00
Dominion Potable Water Ground Storage Tank NO BID
0.06 MG; 26 feet diam.; 16 feet height
Inspection Cost Drained 175.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,100.00 1,050.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
8. TOTAL 1,814.00 2,298.00
Dominion Potable Water Hydro-Pneumatic Tank
0.004 MG; 6 feet diam.; 22 feet length
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 299.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 50.00 125.00
Drained Cleaning cost out of service 300.00 995.00
9. TOTAL 550.00 1,419.00
Dos Rios Reuse Water Hydro-pneumatic Tank
0.02 MG; 10 feet diam; 6.5 feet Water Level Tank; 40 feet length
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 299.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 50.00 125.00
Drained Cleaning cost out of service 300.00 1,050.00
10. TOTAL 550.00 1,474.00
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Foster Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2.0 MG; 105 feet diam; 36 feet bowl height; 150+/- feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
11. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,898.00
Fredericksburg Reuse Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.0 MG; 74 feet diam.; 38 feet bowl height; 135 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 2,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,000.00 750.00
12. TOTAL 4,355.00 4,448.00
Grissom Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2.5 MG; 102 feet diam.; 49.6 feet bowl height; 185 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.000 NOBID
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 2,850.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
13. TOTAL 2,355.00 4,098.00
Hildebrand Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2 MG; 95.0 feet diam.; 45 feet bowl height; 119 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 2,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
14. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,898.00
Indian Springs Potable Water Standpipe
3 MG; 64 feet diam.; 129 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 350.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,600.00 4,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
15. TOTAL 2,500.00 5,498.00
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Inwood Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
1.2 MG; 80 feet diam; 35 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,400.00 2,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
16. TOTAL 2,255.00 4,198.00
Stotzer Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
2.2 MG, 84.0 feet diam.; 51.0 feet overall height;
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,400.00 6,750.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,000.00 2,150.00
17. TOTAL 4,255.00 10,148.00 NO BID
Amhurst Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.8 MG, 62 feet diam.; 110 feet overall height;
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,400.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
18. TOTAL 2,255.00 3,198.00
Bear Springs Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.28 MG, 32 feet diam.; 48 feet overall height;
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,100.00 1,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
19. TOTAL 1,889.00 2,498.00
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Echo Mountain Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2.5 MG, 105 feet diam.; 155 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 2,850.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
20. TOTAL 2,355.00 4,098.00
Fleetwood Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.5 MG, 55 feet diam.; 84.5 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,400.00 1,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
21. TOTAL 2,230.00 2,898.00 NO BID
Knights Cross Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
6 MG, 90 feet diam.; 128 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 8,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
22. TOTAL 2,375.00 9,698.00
New World Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2.0 MG, 70 feet diam.; 164 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 2,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
23. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,898.00
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Sea World Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
2 MG, 85 feet diam.; 50 feet overall height;
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,400.00 3,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
24. TOTAL 2,255.00 4,898.00
Texas Research Park Welded Steel Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.25 MG, 54 feet diam.; 15 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,100.00 1,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
25. TOTAL 1,889.00 2,498.00 NO BID
Texas Research Park Prestressed Concrete Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
2.0 MG, 103 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 3,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
26. TOTAL 2,355.00 4,898.00
West Avenue Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.5 MG, 50 feet diam.; 145 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not drained) 1,500.00 2,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
27. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,398.00
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Minor Repairs (Item F) 250.00 200.00
Hourly Rate for 40 hours 10,000.00 8,000.00
28. TOTAL 10,000.00 8,000.00
Emergency Services (Item E) 1,150.00
4 ea. Mobilation 0.00 4,600.00
60 hours., Hourly Rate 350.00 200.00
21,000.00 12,000.00
29. TOTAL 21,000.00 16,600.00
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR YEAR 2014 (ITEMS 1-28) 99,292.00 142,264.00
2015 TANK INSPECTION & CLEANING PRICING LIST
34th St. Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
5 MG; 164.5 feet diam.; 44.3 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 3,800.00 8,400.00 NO BID
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 250.00
1. TOTAL 4,775.00 9,648.00
Anderson Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 1
7.5 MG; 165 feet diam.; 48 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 3,800.00 10,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 250.00
2. TOTAL 4,775.00 11,498.00
ASR Clearwell No.2 Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
7.5 MG; 227 feet diam.; 47.5 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 350.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 4,750.00 10,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 250.00 250.00
3. TOTAL 5,800.00 11,498.00
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Babcock Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2.5 MG; 104 feet diam.; 160 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,500.00 2,850.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
4. TOTAL 2,355.00 4,098.00
Broadview Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
4.5 MG; 138 feet diam.; 42.5 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,500.00 8,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
5. TOTAL 2,355.00 9,398.00
Callaghan Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank NO BID
1.0 MG; 91.3 feet diam; 39 feet bowl height; 112.5 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,500.00 2,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
6. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,398.00
Devine Reuse Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.2 MG; 84 feet diam.; 43 feet bowl height; 83 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,500.00 2,550.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 850.00
7. TOTAL 4,505.00 4,648.00
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East Houston Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
1.0 MG; 75 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,350.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 750.00
8. TOTAL 4,505.00 4,348.00
Pearsall Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
2.5 MG; 120 feet diam.; 33 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 175.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,600.00 3,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 175.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,800.00 1,250.00
9. TOTAL 5,325.00 5,948.00 NO BID
Pinn Rd. Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
3 MG; 84 feet diam.; 80 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 4,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 1,575.00
10. TOTAL 4,505.00 6,973.00
Salado Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
5 MG, 172.0 feet diam.; 30.5 feet overall height;
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 2,800.00 8,400.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
11. TOTAL 3,725.00 9,648.00
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South Foster Potable Water Storage Tank
2.0 MG, 100 feet diam.; 40 feet bowl height; 164.5 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 2,800.00 5,800.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
12. TOTAL 3,705.00 7,048.00
Turtle Creek #2 Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 1
0.5 MG, 52 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,400.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
13. TOTAL 2,230.00 3,198.00 NO BID
Turtle Creek #2 Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 2
0.5 MG, 52 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,400.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
14. TOTAL 2,230.00 3,198.00
Wourzbach Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 1
7.5 MG, 181 feet diam.; 40 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 350.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 4,000.00 10,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
15. TOTAL 4,950.00 11,498.00

10
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Wurzbach Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 2
7.5 MG, 181 feet diam.; 40 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 3,800.00 10,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
16. TOTAL 4,655.00 11,498.00
Edgewood (SW 21 St) Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
1 MG; 75 feet diam.; 34 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 2,800.00 2,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
17. TOTAL 3,630.00 3,498.00
General McMullen Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.25 MG; 40 feet diam.; 136 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A NO BID
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,250.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
18. TOTAL 2,069.00 2,698.00
Golden Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
12.5 MG; 226 feet diam.; 50 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 350.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 275.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 400.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 3,800.00 14,500.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 175.00 250.00
19. TOTAL 5,000.00 15,748.00
Hutchins Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.5 MG; 50 feet diam.; 159 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,400.00 1,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
20. TOTAL 2,255.00 2,898.00
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King Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.5 MG; 52 feet diam.; 34 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
21. TOTAL 1,919.00 3,198.00
La Rosa Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
3 MG; 122 feet diam.; 34 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,600.00 4,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 1,500.00 250.00
22. TOTAL 3,805.00 5,498.00
Somerset Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.3 MG; 40 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A NO BID
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
23. TOTAL 1,919.00 2,898.00
Vestal Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.5 MG; 91 feet diam.; 162 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
24, TOTAL 2,355.00 3,498.00
West Avenue Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.5 MG, 50 feet diam.; 145 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 1,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
25. TOTAL 2,355.00 2,898.00
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Wild Turkey Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.5 MG, 55 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
26. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,198.00
Minor Repairs (Item F) 250.00 200.00
Hourly Rate for 40 hours 10,000.00 8,000.00
27. TOTAL 10,000.00 8,000.00
Emergency Services (Item E) 1,150.00
4 ea. Mobilation 0.00 4,600.00
28. 60 hours., Hourly Rate 350.00 200.00
21,000.00 12,000.00
TOTAL 21,000.00 16,600.00
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR YEAR 2015 (ITEMS 1 —28) 121,412.00 188,173.00 NO BID
2016 TANK INSPECTION & CLEANING PRICING LIST
Avrtesia Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
5 MG; 164.5 feet diam.; 42.3 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 8,400.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
1. TOTAL 2,355.00 9,648.00
Brooks Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
0.5 MG; 54 feet diam.; 27 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,400.00 2,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 850.00
2. TOTAL 4,369.00 4,348.00
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Coliseum Reuse Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.5 MG; 75 feet diam.; 43 feet bowl height; 140 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 850.00
3. TOTAL 4,505.00 4,248.00
Concept Therapy Potable Water Concrete Standpipe No. 1
0.03 MG; 10 feet diam.; 36 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,400.00 850.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
4. TOTAL 2,150.00 2,098.00
Concept Therapy Potable Water Concrete Standpipe No. 2
0.03 MG; 10 feet diam.; 36 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00 NO BID
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,400.00 850.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
5. TOTAL 2,100.00 2,098.00
Concept Therapy Potable Water Concrete Standpipe No. 3
0.03 MG; 10 feet diam.; 36 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,400.00 850.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
6. TOTAL 2,100.00 2,098.00
Concept Therapy Potable Water Hydro-pneumatic Tank 0.01 MG;
6.0 feet diam.; 24 inches Water/Level Tank; 6.0 feet length
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 299.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 125.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 1,150.00
7. TOTAL 600.00 1,574.00
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Dos-Rios Reuse Water Hydro-Pneumatic Tank
2.0 MG; 10 feet diam.; 6.5 feet Water Level Tank; 40 feet length
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 299.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 50.00 125.00
Drained Cleaning Cost Out Of Service 300.00 2,150.00
8. TOTAL 550.00 2,574.00
Fredericksburg Reuse Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.0 MG; 74 feet diam.; 38 feet bowl height; 135 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,500.00 2,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 750.00
9. TOTAL 4,505.00 4,448.00
General McMullen Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2 MG; 95 feet diam.; 45 feet bowl height; 135 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00 NO BID
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
10. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,898.00
Helotes / Adobe Ranch Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
5 MG; 150 feet diam.; 41.8 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 2,100.00 8,400.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
11. TOTAL 3,005.00 9,648.00
Helotes Park #3 Potable Water Standpipe
0.27 MG; 21.5 feet diam.; 100 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 350.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
12. TOTAL 2,280.00 3,398.00

15




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-5078

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM

Q
P. O. BOX 2449 S s g
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 @ “ 3 8
TABULATION OF BIDS 2 S 3 S _. 8
c 9% | fos | £23
prorosaLAnnual Contract for T oS S8R oo
FOR: Potable and Reuse Water Storage Tank Cleaning and Inspection T—:) 3 = =< ; ; =) 5. E
mvmee  (January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014) 8 g s SEIL g < g
pate:  3:00 p.m., November 12, 2013 § S 85 5 S8
E SO 33 = Suw=
ITEMNO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < £ o L = - - 4~ o
Hills Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
3 MG; 90 feet diam.; 64 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 4,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
13. TOTAL 2,355.00 5,498.00
Judson Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
0.5 MG; 40 feet diam.; 139.5 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,400.00 1,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
14. TOTAL 2,255.00 2,898.00
Marshall Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.55 MG; 55 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A NO BID
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,400.00 2,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
15. TOTAL 2,230.00 3,398.00
Naco Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
7.5 MG; 165 feet diam.; 52.2 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 350.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 10,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
16. TOTAL 2,530.00 11,498.00
Randolph Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
5 MG; 165 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 350.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 8,400.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
17. TOTAL 2,530.00 9,648.00
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Seale Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 2
3 MG; 90 feet diam.; 64.5 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 323.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 4,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
18. TOTAL 2,353.00 5,498.00
Stotzer Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
2.2 MG, 84.0 feet diam.; 51.0 feet overall height;
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained). 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained). 1,500.00 3,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 1,250.00
19. TOTAL 4,480.00 5,948.00
Winwood Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
2 MG; 84 feet diam.; 48 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00 NO BID
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 3,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
20. TOTAL 2,330.00 4,498.00
Winwood Potable Water Hydro-Pneumatic Storage Tank
3MG,; 10 feet diam.; 7 feet overall height; 36 feet length
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 299.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 125.00
Drained Cleaning Cost Out Of Service 300.00 2,050.00
21. TOTAL 600.00 2,474.00
Cagnon Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
1.0 MG; 74.0 feet diam.; 34.0 feet Water Level Tank
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
22. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,198.00
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Cagnon Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.0 MG; 64 feet diam.; 168 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
23. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,198.00
CR3820 Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.25 MG; 39 feet diam.; 32 feet to overflow
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,750.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
24. TOTAL 1,919.00 2,998.00
Far West Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.5 MG; 61 feet diam.; 24 feet to overflow
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 300.00 499.00 NO BID
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,050.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
25. TOTAL 2,330.00 3,298.00
Stevens Ranch Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2.5 MG; 103.0 feet diam.; 205.0 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 2,850.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
26. TOTAL 2,505.00 4,098.00
Minor Repairs (Item F) 250.00 200.00
Hourly Rate for 40 hours 10,000.00 8,000.00
27. TOTAL 10,000.00 8,000.00
Emergency Services (Item E) 0.00|1,150.00
4 ea. Mobilation 350.00 4,600.00
60 hours., Hourly Rate 21,000.00(200.00
12,000.00
28. TOTAL 21,000.00 16,600.00
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR YEAR 2015 ITEMS 1 —28) 95,001.00 142,826.00
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2017 TANK INSPECTION & CLEANING PRICING LIST
Devine Reuse Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.2 MG; 84 feet diam.; 83 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,400.00 1,250.00
1. TOTAL 4,755.00 4,948.00
Dwyer Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
1 MG; 75 feet diam.; 173 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,150.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
2. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,398.00
East Houston Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
1 MG; 75 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A NO BID
Inspection Cost In-Service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-Service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,350.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,150.00 750.00
3. TOTAL 4,505.00 4,348.00
Helotes Park #2
0.1 MG; 20 feet diam.; 108 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,400.00 1,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
4. TOTAL 2,205.00 2,898.00
Lockhill Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.5 MG; 91.3 feet diam.; 195 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
5. TOTAL 19 2,355.00 3,498.00
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Maltsberger Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
7.5 MG; 165 feet diam.; 48 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 250.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 350.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 3,800.00 10,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 250.00
6. TOTAL 4,800.00 11,498.00
Menger Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
1.5 MG; 88 feet diam.; 105 feet to overflow
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 2,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
7. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,498.00
Pinn Rd. Reuse Water Ground Storage Tank
3 MG; 84 feet diam.; 80 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00 NO BID
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 6,250.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
Sedimentation Transport fees 2,500.00 1,450.00
8. TOTAL 5,005.00 8,948.00
Ranch Town No. 2 Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
1 MG; 80 feet diam.; 27 feet height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,500.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
9. TOTAL 2,355.00 3,198.00
Redland Potable Water Elevated Storage Tank
2.0 MG; 105 feet diam.; 91 feet to overflow
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,600.00 2,650.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
10. TOTAL 2,455.00 3,898.00
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Shields Potable Water Reservoir Storage Tank
5.0 MG; 116.5.0 feet diam.; 73.0 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 200.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 8,400.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
11. TOTAL 2,555.00 9,648.00
Woods of Fair Oaks Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 1
0.48 MG; 24 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,250.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
12. TOTAL 2,069.00 2,698.00
Woods of Fair Oaks Potable Water Ground Storage Tank No. 2
0.46 MG; 22 feet diam.; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A NO BID
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,250.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
13. TOTAL 2,069.00 2,698.00
Village Green Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.155 MG; 28 feet diam; 32 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,250.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
14. TOTAL 2,069.00 2,698.00
Anagua Springs Potable Water Ground Storage Tank 1
0.06 MG; 26 feet diam.; 16 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
15. TOTAL 1,789.00 2,698.00
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Anaqua Springs Potable Water Ground Storage Tank 2
0.06 MG; 26 feet diam.; 16 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
16. TOTAL 1,789.00 2,698.00
Anaqua Springs Potable Water Ground Storage Tank 3
0.06 MG; 26 feet diam.; 16 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
17. TOTAL 1,789.00 2,698.00
Anaqua Springs Potable Water Ground Storage Tank 4
0.06 MG; 26 feet diam.; 16 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00 NO BID
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
18. TOTAL 1,789.00 2,698.00
Bear Springs Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
0.28 MG; 32 feet diam.; 48 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 200.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 289.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,100.00 1,450.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 100.00 250.00
19. TOTAL 1,789.00 2,698.00
Edgewood (SW 21%) Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
1.0 MG; 75 feet diam.; 34 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
20. TOTAL 2,505.00 3,198.00
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Lemonwood Potable Water Ground Storage Tank
1.0 MG; 75 feet diam.; 34 feet overall height
Inspection Cost Drained 230.00 499.00
Drained Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 N/A
Inspection Cost In-service (not-drained) 325.00 499.00
Cleaning Cost In-service (not-drained) 1,650.00 1,950.00
Underwater Cleaning cost per additional 1" of sedimentation 150.00 250.00
21. TOTAL 2,505.00 3,198.00
Minor Repairs (Item F) 250.00 200.00
Hourly Rate for 40 hours 10,000.00 8,000.00
22. TOTAL 10,000.00 8,000.00
Emergency Services (Item E) 0.00 1,150.00
4,600.00 NOBID
4 ea. Mobilation 350.00 200.00
60 hours., Hourly Rate 21,000.00 12,000.00
23. TOTAL 21,000.00 16,600.00
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR YEAR 2015 ITEMS 1 —28) 86,862.00 112,358.00
*
TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR YEARS 2014-2017 402,567.00 585,621.00
5% 1%
Terms 7 days 20 days
*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

American Underwater Services, Inc.
Liquid Engineering Corp.
Texas Tank Services
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